
 
NOTICE OF MEETING 

MAJORCA ISLES 
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 

 
A meeting of the Board of Supervisors of the Majorca Isles Community Development 
District will be held on January 20, 2021 at 5:00 pm at the Miami-Dade Public Library, 
North Dade Regional Library Branch, located at  2455 NW 183 St.  Miami Gardens, 
FL 33056. At the meeting, the board will discuss organizational matters, and any other 
business which may lawfully and properly comes before the board. The notice is given 
in accordance with the requirements of section 189.417 Florida Statutes. The meeting is 
open to the public and will be conducted in accordance with the provisions of Florida 
Law for Community Development Districts. This meeting may be continued to a date, 
time, and place to be specified on the record at the meeting. A copy of the agenda for 
this meeting may be obtained from the District Attorney  www.eric@condo-laws.com or 
District Chairman, chairman@majorcacdd.com. 
Any person requiring special accommodations at this meeting because of a disability or 
physical impairment should contact the District Office at (786) 499-7554 at least five 
calendar days prior to the meeting. 
 
Each person who decides to appeal any action taken at these meetings is advised that 
person will  need a record of the proceedings and that accordingly, the person may 
need to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made, including the 
testimony and evidence upon which such appeal is to be based. 
 

Eric Glazer 
District Attorney 

 
Upcoming Regular Meeting 
 
The Board of Supervisors for the Majorca Isles Community Development District 
("District") will hold a regular District meeting: 
 
 
DATE: January 20, 2021 | TIME 5:00PM 
 
Location: North Dade Regional Library     
                     2455 NW 183 St.  Miami Gardens, FL 33056 
 
Join the meeting by Zoom: 
https://8x8.vc/glazers/eric.glazer 
 
Join by phone: dial 1 209-844-4600, enter access code 64898576#If also dialing-in 
through a room phone, join without connecting to audio: 
https://8x8.vc/glazers/eric.glazer#config.startSilent=true 
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